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With the spread of the coronavirus (COVID-19), and tri-fold spread of fear relating to the same, State agencies have
begun to take action with respect to care relating to coronavirus.  Specifically, State Medicaid programs across the
nation are beginning to review both cost-sharing policies, such as member co-payments, as well as utilization
review policies, such as prior authorization processes, to ensure timely access to care for Medicaid beneficiaries. In
some states, there are similar actions being taken with commercial insurance through State Insurance
departments.

The Indiana Family and Social Services Administration (FSSA) recently announced that Indiana Medicaid will cover
all COVID-19 diagnostic testing without copayments from members. In addition, two new codes specific to the
diagnostic panel and laboratory tests associated with the diagnosis of COVID-19 will be added effective April 1,
2020 with a retroactive date for claims starting on or after February 4, 2020.[1]

By contrast, other states have taken slightly broader measures beyond testing alone. For instance, in California, the
Department of Managed Health Care issued an all-plan letter requiring insurers, including Medi-Cal Health Care
Service Plans, to immediately reduce cost-sharing to zero for all medically necessary screening and testing for the
coronavirus, including hospital, emergency department, urgent care, and provider office visits, where the purpose
of the visit is to be screened or tested for COVID-19.[2]  California is also encouraging insurers to waive prior
authorization requests for services related to COVID-19.  Similarly, in Michigan, Governor Whitmer announced that
the Michigan Medicaid program will waive all copayments and cost-sharing for testing and health care treatment
related to COVID-19[3], and the program will expand telehealth by allowing beneficiaries to received telehealth
services in their homes.[4]

While many of the Medicaid notifications published thus far are for services related directly to COVID-19, we may
begin to see movement on agency-required procedures that are indirectly related to COVID-19, where lawful.  For
example, we may see the waiver of prior authorization requirements for other drugs and services, other than
COVID-19 screening, as well as the continued expansion of telemedicine services. While not directly related to the
testing and treatment of COVID-19, these changes to policies and procedures would support the overall goal of
freeing hospital resources to address true emergencies and containment of the spread of the virus, as well as
reduce unnecessary patient-to-patient interactions (wherein an otherwise healthy patient interacts with a patient

kriegdevault.com

https://www.kriegdevault.com/index.php/professionals/meghan-mcnab


that has contracted COVID-19, merely due to the patient adhering to a Medicaid-required protocol).

We will continue to closely monitor the quickly evolving situation for impacts to the healthcare regulatory and
reimbursement landscape. For questions regarding Medicaid policy concerns, particularly as they relate to your
ability to address the coronavirus, please contact Meghan M. Linvill McNab.
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